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After the grand success of Spine 2020, we welcome 
you afresh for the 6th International Conference on 
Spine and Spinal Disorders slated on May 06-07, 2020 
in Prague, Czech Republic. 

 
This year we aim to incorporate each unattended 
sector related to Spine and Spinal Disorders with the 
refreshing theme of “Exploration and Innovations 
Which Contribute Hand Towards Curing and 
Understanding the Diverse Aspects of Spine and 
Spinal Disorders” 

 
First of all, we extend our thanks to all of our excellent 
keynotes, speakers, conference attendees, students, 
associations, media partners, exhibitors and guests 
who made this Spine 2019 Congress as the most 
successful and victorious event. We welcome you all 
to Spine 2020 event to make it has a successful event. 

 
“Globalize your Research at Spine 2020, Prague” 
Spine 2020 is your best opportunity to reach the 
largest assemblage of participants from around the 
world on a single platform. At this 2-day meeting, the 

event will provide a great opportunity to highlight 
your work and receive recognition and certificates 
from our respected world-class organizing committee. 

 
Let's meet and explore the beautiful city of Prague. 

 
For more details, kindly visit: 
http://spine.alliedacademies.com/ 
For General queries, kindly write us at: 
spine@alliedforums.org  
For Queries related to Abstract Submission and 
Registration, drop us an email at: 
spine@neurologymeeting.com  
You can also send us your queries through WhatsApp 
at: 44-1236268004 
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